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St George’s Lowville  March 15, 2018 

Announcements 

 Sunday March 18th at 9:30 am. Lent 5 Eucharist.  Parish meeting 
after the service. 

  Food this month is being collected for St. Matthew’s House and will 

be blessed next week, Palm Sunday, March 25th. 

 Sundays in Lent: We are reading through Mark’s account of the last 
week of Jesus’ earthly life, with an accompanying sermon series and 
opportunity for discussion for those interested after the service.   

 Anyone wishing to have Easter flowers in memory of a loved one can 
submit their flower envelope by March 25th.Envelopes are in the 
Narthex. 

 Sunday March 25th at 9:30 am. Palm Sunday, with procession of 
palms.  

 Sunday March 25th at 2 pm Contemplative Group 

 Holy Week.  Plans are for a Seder meal and Eucharist in the parish 
hall on Maundy Thursday March 29 at 6 p.m. with altar stripping in 
the church after the meal.  The Good Friday service at 9:30 will 
feature a video presentation of the Passion story. 

 Easter Sunday, April 1: Sunrise service at 6:45 am; light breakfast to 
follow.  Family Eucharist at 9:30 am. 

 Get your tickets! Sunday May 6th at 2:00 pm St. George’s presents 
an” Old Time Country Fiddle Music & Variety Show”.  Tickets are 
$15.00 and are available in the church office or from Bonnie Powell or 
Susan Recoskie. Poster on bulletin board. 

 The next worship ministers’ schedule is currently under construction. 
If you would like to be a reader, server, counter, prayer leader or 
greeter, please contact Michelle Normandin ASAP to be on the list. 
Also if there are any dates that won’t work for you please let Michelle 
know @ windrush@gmail.com.   

Ongoing announcements 

 Prayer Chain: For confidential requests for prayer by prayer chain 
members, please contact Bev Mitchell: m.beverlyj@cogeco.ca or 
905-878-7505 

 We are in need of singers! Come lend your voice to our songs. 
Practice on Sunday mornings before church @ 8:45 am. All welcome. 

 Morning Prayer is said every Wednesday and Thursday morning at 
9:15 am.  All are welcome to join us. 
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